

Bid Tab for Bid# B02711

Quote Info:

(005648) B M B ENTERPRIS
<Quote: Q009220>

(016243) LONGADE INC
<Quote: Q009221>

(016240) P G S INC
<Quote: Q009222>

(016241) POLYDOROS
PETRO
<Quote: Q009223>

(016267) ROBERT D'ERCOLE
<Quote: Q009224>

(008742) T J _CO INC
<Quote: Q009225>

Item Info:

LINCOLN WOODS [2BO] <1.000> ANNUAL 1.0	No Bid NB,DD	No Bid DD,NB	\$14,133.00 \$14,133.00 *,NB,DD	No Bid DD,NB	No Bid NB,DD	No Bid DD,NB
HAINES MEMORIAL PARK <2.000> ANNUAL 1.0	No Bid DD,NB	No Bid NB,DD	No Bid DD,NB	No Bid NB,DD	No Bid DD,NB	No Bid NB,DD
COLT STATE PARK [2BO] <3.000> ANNUAL 1.0	No Bid NB,DD	No Bid DD,NB	No Bid NB,DD	No Bid DD,NB	No Bid NB,DD	No Bid DD,NB
BRENTON POINT STATE <4.000> ANNUAL 1.0	No Bid DD,NB	\$8,200.00 \$8,200.00 *,NB,DD	No Bid DD,NB	No Bid NB,DD	No Bid DD,NB	No Bid NB,DD
FORT ADAMS STATE PAF <5.000> ANNUAL 1.0	No Bid NB,DD	No Bid DD,NB	No Bid NB,DD	No Bid DD,NB	No Bid NB,DD	No Bid DD,NB
GODDARD MEMORIAL ST <6.000> ANNUAL 1.0	\$15,000.00 \$15,000.00 *,DD,NB	No Bid NB,DD	No Bid DD,NB	No Bid NB,DD	\$27,009.00 \$27,009.00 DD,NB	No Bid NB,DD
SCARBOROUGH STATE I <7.000> ANNUAL 1.0	No Bid NB,DD	No Bid DD,NB	No Bid NB,DD	No Bid DD,NB	No Bid NB,DD	\$51,777.00 \$51,777.00 *,DD,NB
ROGER WHEELER STATI <8.000> ANNUAL 1.0	No Bid DD,NB	No Bid NB,DD	No Bid DD,NB	\$23,500.00 \$23,500.00 *,NB,DD	No Bid DD,NB	No Bid NB,DD

Bid Tab for Bid# B02711

Quote Info:	(005648) B M B ENTERPRIS <Quote: Q009220>	(016243) LONGADE INC <Quote: Q009221>	(016240) P G S INC <Quote: Q009222>	(016241) POLYDOROS PETRO <Quote: Q009223>	(016267) ROBERT D'ERCOLE <Quote: Q009224>	(008742) T J _CO INC <Quote: Q009225>
--------------------	--	--	--	---	--	--

Item Info:

EAST MATUNUCK STATE <9.000>	No Bid	No Bid	\$13,155.00 \$13,155.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
ANNUAL 1.0	NB,DD	DD,NB	*,NB,DD	DD,NB	NB,DD	DD,NB
MISQUAMICUT STATE BE <10.000>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$48,777.00 \$48,777.00
ANNUAL 1.0	DD,NB	NB,DD	DD,NB	NB,DD	DD,NB	*,NB,DD

Totals:	Net \$ Total:	\$15,000.00	\$8,200.00	\$27,288.00	\$23,500.00	\$27,009.00	\$100,554.00
	\$ Discount:	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
	\$ Awarded:	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
	Eval Codes: NI	Eval Codes: NI	Eval Codes: NI	Eval Codes: NI	Eval Codes: NI	Eval Codes: NI	Eval Codes: NI

Evaluation Code Descriptions:

DD = Delivery Date Greater Than Requested Date
 NB = No Bid
 NI = Did Not Bid All Items

Bid Tab for Bid# B02711

Quote (016384) DELS LEMONADE O
Info: <Quote: Q009422>

Item Info:

LINCOLN WOODS [2BO] <1.000>	No Bid
ANNUAL 1.0	NB,DD

HAINES MEMORIAL PARK <2.000>	No Bid
ANNUAL 1.0	NB,DD

COLT STATE PARK [2BO] <3.000>	\$53,300.00 \$53,300.00
ANNUAL 1.0	*,NB,DD

BRENTON POINT STATE <4.000>	No Bid
ANNUAL 1.0	NB,DD

FORT ADAMS STATE PAF <5.000>	No Bid
ANNUAL 1.0	NB,DD

GODDARD MEMORIAL ST <6.000>	No Bid
ANNUAL 1.0	NB,DD

SCARBOROUGH STATE I <7.000>	No Bid
ANNUAL 1.0	NB,DD

ROGER WHEELER STATI <8.000>	No Bid
ANNUAL 1.0	NB,DD

Bid Tab for Bid# B02711

Quote (016384) DELS LEMONADE O
Info: <Quote: Q009422>

Item Info:

EAST MATUNUCK STATE <9.000>	No Bid
ANNUAL 1.0	NB,DD

MISQUAMICUT STATE BE <10.000>	No Bid
ANNUAL 1.0	NB,DD

Totals: Net \$ Total: \$53,300.00
\$ Discount: \$0.00
\$ Awarded: \$0.00

Eval Codes: NI

Evaluation Code Descriptions:

DD = Delivery Date Greater Than Requested Date
NB = No Bid
NI = Did Not Bid All Items